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LANDING REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (RFQ) EMAIL 

XXXX

XXXX

NOTE
This slide shows the 

email received by 
suppliers when an RFQ 

has been sent.
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION 

NOTE
This slide shows the 

landing page where all 
requests sent to the 

supplier will be listed. 
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION 

NOTE
Upon drilling down on a 
request, the supplier will 
then be able to indicate 

willingness to 
participate, or to decline 
the invitation (as shown 

on the buttons 
highlighted). Details of 

the event invited for can 
be viewed on this page 



Classification: Internal

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION 

NOTE
The terms will be 

outlined on this page. 
An option to accept or 
‘reject’ are available
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION 

NOTE
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION 

NOTE
Supplier will be 

requested to indicate 
and submit their prices 

as per the request, 
against each item.

PS: Note that you will be 
required to attached a 

quotation (In PDF) 
before submitting your 

response…see 
highlighted field
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION 

NOTE
An attachment 

(Quotation (PDF)) 

(Click on “Choose file, 
select your file then click 

on OK button to save 
the attachment)
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REQUEST FOR QUOTATION 

NOTE
Click on the ‘Submit 

Entire Response’ button.

PS: You may use the 
‘Compose message’ 

button to communicate 
with the Debswana 

Procurement Officer 
before submitting the 

response
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NOTE (Website URL)
Supplier.ariba.com 

This will land you on 
your log-on page 

Logging onto Ariba Network Directly
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Ariba business network navigation

NOTE
At this point you will 
have access to your 
Ariba network page 

(DASHBOARD)

PS: Make sure you are 
logged on the ‘Business 

Network’ (avoid 
activating the 

‘Enterprise Account’)
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NOTE
This page enables you to 

select the different 
views

Note that the 
‘Workbench’ tab will 

allow you to customise 
your page view (Orders, 

New orders, Invoices 
etc.)

The ‘Orders’ tab allows 
you to list all order sent 
from Debswana. Ensure 
you specify the selection 

period accurately
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Order confirmation

NOTE
Upon selection of the 
order to respond to, 

only the ‘Create Order 
Confirmation’ button 

will be activated
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Order confirmation

NOTE
Ensure that you check 

the details of the order, 
then select ‘Confirm 

Entire Order’ to submit 
your confirmation

PS: Do not do item-
wise confirmation 

(Update Line Items).

Select ‘Reject Entire 
Order’ if there’s any 

clarity / query that you 
wish to be addressed 

first.
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Order Confirmation

NOTE
It is not mandatory to 

attach any 
invoices/Delivery notes 

at the point of ‘order 
confirmation’

Ensure all ‘mandatory’ 
fields are populated 
(note the ones with 

asterisk (*))
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ORDER CONFIRMATION

NOTE
Click on the ‘Next’ 

button to proceed at 
this stage (or move onto 

the next pages, 
depending on the 

number of order lines)



Classification: Internal

ORDER CONFIRMATION

NOTE
Click on ‘Submit’ to 

submit the order 
confirmation
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ORDER CONFIRMATION

NOTE
After confirmation, the 
status of the order will 
indicate ‘Confirmed’. 
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Advanced Ship Notice

NOTE
At this stage you will be 

enabled to create a ‘Ship 
Notice’

NB: Ensure the order 
status shows 
‘Confirmed’
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Advanced Ship Notice

NOTE
When creating a ‘Ship 
Notice’ ensure that an 
invoice is attached, the 
date on which delivery 

will be made to 
Debswana is captured 

accurately on the 
‘Delivery date’ field
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Advanced Ship Notice

NOTE
Click on ‘next’ to 

proceed
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Advanced Ship Notice

NOTE
Click on ‘Submit’ to 

submit the ‘Ship Notice’ 
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Advanced Ship Notice

NOTE
The status on the order 
will change to ‘Shipped’ 
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Service Entry Sheets

NOTE
To create Service Sheet’ 
click on ‘Create Service 

Sheet’
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NOTE
If your order has 

multiple service line 
items then this screen 

will pop up. You’ll need 
to select one and click 

next.

NB: for service sheets, 
please ensure that you 

prepare one service 
sheet line per service 

sheet.

Service Entry Sheets
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Service Entry Sheets

NOTE
All fields mandatory 

fields on this page are 
marked with an asterisk 

(*)

Service sheet number 
field must carry invoice 

number. The 'Service 
Sheet Date' field must 

carry the date of 
creation of the SES

Click on 'Add to Header' 
to get to attach an 
Invoice on the SES
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NOTE
Click on the ‘Add’ 

dropdown to get to 
select “..Add unplanned 

item..” . 
Then proceed to give a 

description of the 
service rendered under 

the ‘Part 
No./Description’ field.

(Hint: Copy the 
description on the field 
highlighted in ‘orange’ 
to the field highlighted 

in ‘green’)
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NOTE
Click on the ‘Add’ 

dropdown to get to 
select “..Add unplanned 

item..” . 
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NOTE
Then proceed to give a 

description of the 
service rendered under 

the ‘Part 
No./Description’ field.

(Hint: Copy the 
description on the field 
highlighted in ‘orange’ 
to the field highlighted 

in ‘green’)
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NOTE
Ensure the ‘Type’ field 
is populated as Service.

Populate the ‘Qty/Unit 
and Price’ fields as per 

the purchase order that 
you received from 

Debswana. To populate 
the unit, click on the 

‘(no value)’ dropdown 
to select the unit. Enter 

the price under the 
‘Price’ field, the click on 
the ‘Update’ button at 
the bottom to update 

the ‘Subtotal’

Then click on the ‘Next’ 
button
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NOTE
Check and confirm that 

the values and 
descriptions captured 

are accurate, then click 
on ‘Submit’
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Invoicing

NOTE
Click on the ‘Create 

Invoice’ button

(PS: Ensure that this is 
only done once a Goods 
Receipt or an Approval 
of a Service Entry Sheet 
have been completed 

by Debswana)
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Invoicing

NOTE
Select ‘Standard 
Invoice’ from the 
dropdown menu
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NOTE
(Populate all fields 

with asterisk (*)

Enter the ‘Invoice 
number’. Ensure it 

is the same 
number provided 
during creation of 
SES or Ship Notice.

*(Should the 
system prompt for 

a ‘REMIT – ID’, 
then click on the 

‘View/Edit 
Address’ link and 
update the ‘Remit 
ID’ field with your 

email address)

PS: Refer to the 
slide at end of 
presentation
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NOTE
Select ‘Add to 
Header’ then 

select ‘Add 
Attachment’ to 

attach your 
invoice. Make sure 
the attachment is 

in pdf format.
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NOTE
After you have attached 

your invoice, scroll to 
the bottom of the page 

and select ‘Next’.



Classification: Internal

NOTE
Check to ensure that 

the value for the invoice 
is correct, the 

document is attached, 
then click on ‘Submit’ to 
submit via the network

A confirmation message 
will pop up to verify the 

submission
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NOTE
Status will 
change to 
Invoiced
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NOTE
Go here to 

check if your 
Invoice been 

sent 
successfully
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NOTE
Scroll down from 

the previous screen 
to view the most 

recent invoices you 
have submitted. 
Focus on ‘Invoice 

Status’ and ‘Routing 
Status’, the two 

should be on ‘Sent’ 
and ‘Acknowledged’ 

respectively.
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Contact Details

All queries should be directed to:

SCMDigitalTransformation@debswana.bw

3614302
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